Buyer: Brenda Sensibaugh

6461 OF
Department of Transportation

Chip Seal (Ledge Rock) Aggregate

g Danielski Farms Inc. Gana Trucking and Spencer Querries Inc
£ #517907 Excavating P
- o Extended

Description Qty |UOM| Unit Price Price Unit Price| Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price

1 |D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK HWY 116 & S26 B SPUR MP .102 R 1537|TN $ 3945| % 60,634.65| $ 32.000| $ 49,184.00
2 |D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK HWY 57 JCT 35 & 98 MP 21.69 LF 2495|TN $ 4329 % 108,008.55| $ 31.800(| $ 79,341.00
3 |D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK HWY 15 MP 206.91 LT SIDE 2415[TN $ 39608 95,634.00| $ 28.640| $ 69,165.60
4 _|D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK HWY 57 MP 52.78 LT SIDE 1355[TN $ 4073[ % 55,189.15| § 29.600| $ 40,108.00
5 |D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK HWY 12 MP 190.05 CROFTON YARD 975[TN $ 4410[ 8 4299750 $§ 26.460] $ 25,798.50
6 |D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK HWY 12 MP 201.10 RT SIDE 1419|TN $ 4410| $ 62,577.90( $ 27.100( $ 38,454.90
7 |D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK NIOBRARA MAINT. YARD 5600|TN NO BID $ 27450 $  153,720.00
8 |D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK JCT. N-14 & US20 3100({TN NO BID $ 31.870( $ 98,797.00
9 |D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK CREIGHTON SOUTH N-13 MP 31 2100[TN NO BID $ 32.600| $ 68,460.00
10 |D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK BLOOMFIELD EAST N-84 MP 29 1800|TN $ 4458| % 80,244.00( $ 27.350( $ 49,230.00
11 |D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK NELIGH YARD 2500({TN NO BID $ 34.690]| $ 86,725.00
12 |D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK LYONS 5 NORTH US 77 MP 23.7 4300|TN $ 39.60| $ 170,280.00( $ 31.700( $ 136,310.00
13 |D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK EMERSON N-9 1 NORTH 770[TN $ 37683 29,013.60( $ 30.350[ $ 23,369.50
14 _|D-8 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK AINSWORTH HWY 7 RP 34.9 2400[TN | $ 42.45] $ 101,880.00] NOBID § 42.850[ $  102,840.00
15 |D-8 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK SPRINGVIEW YARD HWY 183 RP 214 1450|TN $ 3775 $ 54,737.50| NOBID $ 37.900| $ 54,955.00
16 |D-8 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK HYANNIS HWY 2 1 MILE W MIX LN 1400|TN $ 42.00| $ 58,800.00| NO BID $ 53450 $ 74,830.00
17 |D-8 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK SPARKS HWY 12 18 MILES OF VALE 1500|TN $ 4155| % 6232500 NOBID $ 41950 $ 62,925.00
18 |D-8 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK VALENTINE HWY 97 (25 M SOUTH) 2300[TN 46.35 106,605.00 O BID 46.700 107,410.00
19 |D-8 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK 32 MILES S OF VALENTINE HWY 97 1400[TN 47.10 65,940.00 O BID 37.250 52,150.00
20 |PRICE PER TON MILEFOR ADD/ALT DELIVERY LOCATIONS 200[TN 0.13 26.00 O BID 0.162 32.40
Total 450,313.50 $  704,579.35 1,373,805.90

Payment Terms 030
Delivery Days ARO 14-21
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Opening Date: 03/25/21



